442 LAWS OF WISCONSIN—Ch. 232.

the rates, to be charged for water to consumers
beyond the corporate limits of said city, shall be
fixed by the common council of such city upon
the recommendation of the board of publie
works thereof,

Bopouling SECTION 2. All laws and parts of laws in con-
flict with the provisions of this act are hereby
repealed,

SecTioN 3. This act shall take effect and be
in force from and after its passage and publi-
cation. ,

Approved April 14, 1897,

No. 423, A.] [Published April 16, 1897.
CHAPTER 232.

AN ACT to amend chapter 256, of the laws of
1891, entitled, “an act to amend chapter 373,
of the laws of 188, entitled “an aect to amend
chapter 22) of the laws of 1887,” entitled ‘an
act to amend chapter 258, of the laws of 1883,
entitled, “an act to provide for the annual
pulb:dication of a railroad map, and appropri-
ating moneys therefor.”

The peaple of the state of Wisconsin, represciuted in
senale and assembly, do ciact as follows:

17,000 copies of Q20 PLON Secti . T 250
oW copiesof  SpcTION 1. Section 1, of chapter 256, of the

map &0 a0 laws of 1891, is hereby amended by striking out
published.  the words “fifteen thousand” where they occur
in the fifth line of said section, and substituting
therefor the words “seventeen thousand;” by
striking out the words “three thousand” wherea
they occur in the tenth line of said section, and
substituting therefor the words “four thonsand
three hundred and thirty;” by striking out the
words “four thousand” where they occur in the



LAWS OF WISOONSIN—Ch. 232.

thirteenth line of said section, and substituting
therefor the words “four thousand gix hundred
and seventy;” by striking out the words “one
thousand” where they occur in the fifteenth line
of said section, and substituting therefor the
words “one thousand six hundred and seventy;”
so that said section when so ameunded shall
read as follows: Section 1. There shall be
published Liennially, under the supervision of
the railroad commissioner, seventeen thousand
copies of the railroad map of Wisconsin, of
which eight thousand copies shall be mounted
on muslin and provided with rollers, to be dis-
tributed by the state superintendent of public
instruction among the schools of the state; four
thousand three hundred and thirty copies shall
be likewise mounted on muslin and provided
with rollers, to be apportioned and delivered to
the members of the legislature; four thousand
six hundred and seventy copies, of which three
thousand shall be nnmounted and one thousand
six hundred and seventy likewise mounted on
muslin and provided with rollers, to be Ais-
tributed by the railroad commissioner; and @
sum of money sufficient to carry out the pro-
visions of this act is hereby appropriated out of
any money in the treasury not otherwise ap-
propriated.

SECTION 2. This act shall take effect and be
in force from and after its passage and publi-
cation.

Approved April 14, 1897,

443



